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Abstract

In the UK, there has been increased awareness of the harm adolescents face beyond 

their families. There is no national strategy for safeguarding adolescents. One inter

vention that comes with particularly high costs is relocation placements by children’s 

social care that move adolescents some distance from their communities. This research 

aims to contribute to the evidence about the relocation of adolescents exposed to, or 

at risk of extra-familial risk/harm. The research reported here sought to explore the 

costs associated with relocation placements. Data were gathered about the time taken 

to carry out the social work processes associated with relocation placements and 

about the costs associated with the placements. Two interviews and six focus groups 

were conducted with twenty-four participants. The findings highlight that each ado

lescent had a unique context, which was influenced by the type of extra-familial risk/ 

harm. The service response therefore needed to be tailored, and unit costs are pre

sented as a range from £22,000 to £170,000 for six months. There is substantial vari

ability in the use and costs of relocation placements. The findings offer evidence for 

earlier intervention to avoid extra-familial risk/harm. The financial costs of relocation 

placements need to be considered within the context of the well-being of 

adolescents.
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Background

Extra-familial risk/harm and out-of-area placements

In the UK, over the past two decades, there has been a shift in the child 
welfare system with an increased awareness of the types of harm adoles
cents (young people aged ten to twenty-five years) can face in contexts 
beyond their families. These harms, commonly known as ‘extra-familial 
risks/harms’, include sexual and criminal exploitation and peer-on-peer 
violence and abuse (HM Government, 2018). Multiple high-profile cases 
of ‘extra-familial risk/harm’, highlighted the inadequacies of social care, 
police and criminal justice responses to such incidents (see Coffey, 2014; 
Jay, 2014; Firmin, 2017) demanding a conversation about who has a re
sponsibility to safeguard adolescents when they encounter significant 
harm beyond their families.

The legislation laid out in the Children Act 1989 has previously been 
interpreted as a duty to safeguard children and young people up to the 
age of eighteen years from abuse within their families. However, as 
awareness grew about the significant harm some adolescents experience, 
primarily outside of their families, this came to be understood as a mat
ter for child welfare agencies (see Ofsted, 2021). This is the context in 
England, the location of the specific study discussed here.

A child welfare response to significant harm beyond the family 
includes the prioritising of adolescents’ best interests over criminal jus
tice or punitive concerns, adolescents’ needs being addressed beyond the 
risk they pose to themselves or others, and resourcing of caring services 
and support that strengthen adolescents’ safe relationships (Lloyd 
et al., 2023).

Research by Firmin (2019) identified that when child welfare agencies 
have not been able to build safety in these extra-familial spaces and rela
tionships, adolescents have been moved away to protect their safety. 
Discussing child removal in cases of intra and extra-familial harm 
Firmin notes: 

in cases of familial abuse social workers may use many other 
interventions before this point to try and create safety while preserving 
the family unit and thereby create physical safety and relational safety 
and safeguard psychological welfare. There are comparably few 
interventions used for extra-familial risk and social workers are not 
trained/equipped to identify opportunities for intervening in peer, school 
or neighbourhood contexts as part of child protection practice. In the ab
sence of contextual interventions, relocation is one tool that can disrupt 
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relationships between ‘risky’ public spaces and a young person’s welfare. 
(Firmin, 2019, p. 534)

As a result, Firmin (2019) suggested that further research was required 
to establish the rate and cost of relocations, noting that in resource- 
deficient local authorities oversight of spending on relocations could fa
cilitate debate and guidance on targeting public space risks with public 
space interventions (minimising the need to move young people away 
from their communities).

In parallel within the UK, there have been increasing concerns about 
the impact of austerity on child welfare services and the shift in spending 
to late intervention services (Franklin et al., 2023). Rising needs and 
costs in children’s services have been cited as one of the biggest drivers 
of financial instability experienced by local authorities in recent years 
(Stride and Woods, 2024). Furthermore, recent research to explore the 
cost pressures faced by local authority children’s services departments 
highlighted the difficulties associated with predicting demand for serv
ices, in particular for adolescent cohorts who require placements 
(Holmes, 2021).

The findings presented here are part of a wider research project that 
explored the rate, cost and impact of out-of-area placements as a re
sponse to extra-familial forms of risk/harm (Firmin et al., 2022; Wroe 
et al., 2023). The research into the rate and impact of relocations identi
fied that approximately one in ten young people known to children’s 
services teams in England and Wales due to risk beyond their families 
were relocated (Firmin et al., 2022) and that there is substantial variabil
ity in their use across England and Wales and little local or national 
oversight of their use. The research suggested multiple drivers for this 
variation, including: the local authority’s strategic position on relocations 
(specifically their decision not to relocate) and investment in alternative 
services; the availability of placements; and pressure from partner organ
isations (primarily the police). Qualitative research with professionals, 
young people and families also identified that relocations, whilst increas
ing perceived physical safety, significantly impacted young people’s rela
tionships and emotional well-being and posed some physical safety risks 
including risks associated with going ‘missing’ from placements and 
self-harm: 

The qualitative reports provided by participants indicate that relocation 
is a common and a substantial intervention with significant consequences 
for young people and their families. Despite this, the participant 
accounts indicate that there are not sufficient planning frameworks or 
thresholds to determine when relocating a young person would be an 
adequate response to [extra-familial harm]. Significantly, in the absence 
of this planning, young people can be relocated to manage physical risk, 
whilst being exposed to a range of relational and emotional harms, as 
well as other forms of physical risk, through increased missing episodes 
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and limited professional relationships and oversight. (Wroe et al., 2023, 
p. 2974).

Importantly, for many professionals and families, relocations were 
used as a ‘last resort’ or when there were no alternative means of keep
ing young people safe. This raised questions about the efficacy of 
‘relocations’ for meeting the safety needs of adolescents who are harmed 
beyond their families and about the resource available to professionals 
to build safety for young people in the relationships and contexts where 
they are being harmed.

In addition to the practical limitations of relocations when it comes to 
building safety around adolescents at risk of harm beyond their families, 
there are legal and ethical concerns. Over the past years, there has been 
a gradual decline in adolescents in youth custodial alongside an increase 
in adolescents secured in residential settings on welfare grounds 
(Bateman, 2017; Williams et al., 2020; Roe and Ryan, 2022). There has 
also been a significant increase in adolescents entering the care system 
for the first time, with this being linked to their experiences of extra- 
familial risk/harm (ADCS, 2018; Children’s Commissioner, 2019).

Whilst the increased visibility of adolescents in child welfare systems, 
including in out-of-home care, distance and secure placements, might in
dicate a promising move away from criminalising adolescents for the 
harm they have experienced in their communities (as early criticisms 
highlighted, see Coffey, 2014; Jay, 2014), it also indicates that risks in the 
community are not being addressed. Rather adolescents are being moved 
away from harmful contexts with significant consequences for their holis
tic safety needs. Many have cautioned the ways in which child welfare 
involvement in families has shifted to monitoring, assessment and disrup
tive interventions at the expense of preventative or restorative support 
that can alleviate the complex drivers of familial and extra-familial harm 
and help keep families together (Featherstone et al., 2018).

Cost of relocations

As outlined above, there is no consistent evidence about the rate or ef
fectiveness of relocation placements in response to extra-familial risk/ 
harm. There are also substantial gaps in the evidence base about the 
costs associated with these placements or whether they offer value for 
money. Ward et al. (2008) highlighted some of the complexities and ad
ditional costs associated with relocation placements, but their research 
had a broader focus—all children over the age of ten in out-of-home 
care, rather than specifically in response to extra-familial risk/harm. 
They also identified that adolescents with the most complex needs who 
entered care during adolescence tended to have the worst outcomes and 
the costliest care pathways. Adolescent entrants into out-of-home care 
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are also more likely to be placed in high-cost placements, yet there 
remains a substantial gap in the evidence about the effectiveness of these 
(Holmes, 2021).

Aims and objectives

The research outlined in this article aims to contribute to the national 
picture of the relocation of adolescents exposed to, or at risk of, extra- 
familial harm in England. It is part of a broader research project that in
vestigated the scale of relocation in different localities in England, Wales 
and Scotland explored the costs and examined the impact of relocation 
on the safety of adolescents, their parents/carers and the professio
nals involved.

The objectives of the broader research project were to: 

1. investigate the rate and cost of relocation placements; 
2. investigate the experiences of adolescents and their families af

fected by relocation (due to extra-familial risk/harm) to establish 
how relocation impacts feelings and experiences of safety; 

3. utilise this information to inform national statutory policy and as
sociated guidance on relocation placements; and 

4. utilise this information to produce resources for adolescents, fami
lies and practitioners. 

The findings reported in this article focus on the first of these objec
tives (cost of relocations) and include an examination of the costs associ
ated with initiating, sustaining and ending out-of-area placements as a 
response to community risk. The findings from the research project con
cerning the rate at which relocations are used in England, Wales and 
Scotland are reported in Firmin et al. (2022). Findings related to the im
pact of relocations on experiences of safety are reported in Wroe 
et al. (2023).

Methods

This article draws on data captured in focus groups and interviews along 
with expenditure and budget information provided by the three partici
pating local authorities. A ‘bottom-up’ unit costing approach was utilised 
(Beecham, 2000). This approach starts with a focus on the smallest com
ponents of an activity or service (i.e. Placement finding) and adds them 
up to provide a total cost. The main advantage of this approach is that it 
facilitates an exploration of variations in activities and costs, and as such 
is well suited for the complex and nuanced child welfare system, 
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particularly for adolescents exposed to extra-familial risk/harm (Firmin 
et al., 2022; Wroe et al., 2023). To estimate unit costs, data were gathered 
about the time taken (on average) to carry out the social work processes 
associated with the decision-making for relocation placements. Data 
were also collected about the costs associated with relocation place
ments, comprising placement fees and allowances, as well as the salaries 
of all involved social care personnel. The data collection methods are de
tailed below.

Recruitment of participants

The fieldwork was conducted online, due to the coronavirus disease 
2019 (COVID-19) pandemic, across three areas (local authorities) in 
England, between April and August 2021. These areas were selected 
from a larger sample of thirteen areas involved in the broader research 
project. Purposive sampling was used to select three in relation to the 
number of adolescents exposed to extra-familial risk/harm. One area had 
a low rate (0–5 per cent), one medium (5–10 per cent) and one with 
high use (10–24 per cent) (Wroe et al., 2023).

After the identification of the three local authorities and their agree
ment to participate in this part of the research project, initial meetings 
were held in each local authority to identify professionals involved in the 
procurement of relocation placements, who could contribute to the focus 
groups and interviews.

Focus groups procedures and participants

The focus groups aimed to ascertain the time spent on key tasks and ac
tivities related to relocation placements. The appropriateness of this 
method to capture time-use activity data within child welfare services 
has been discussed elsewhere (Holmes and McDermid, 2012). The first 
three focus groups were conducted by the researcher leading this cost 
study and supported by a second researcher, and the subsequent three 
focus groups were conducted by the latter. Both researchers have several 
years of experience, and the lead researcher is an expert in child welfare 
time use and unit cost research projects.

Six focus groups were conducted with a total of twenty-one partici
pants. The decision to use this technique to collect data was based on 
the understanding that decisions on the processes and support of adoles
cents who are relocated are taken in the context of specific teams 
(Acocella, 2012). Therefore, professionals from two key teams (i.e. heads 
of services and team managers), who were involved in the decision- 
making process to provide externally commissioned placements, and 
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(case-holding) social workers who supported adolescents relocated due 
to extra-familial risk/harm, were invited to share their knowledge and 
practices. In each local authority, one focus group was conducted with 
decision-making professionals (n¼ 11) and one with social workers 
(n¼ 10) with samples per focus group ranging between two and five 
participants.

The templates for the time-use focus groups with commissioning pro
fessionals and social workers were adapted from previous research using 
this same method (Ward et al., 2008). In the focus groups with those 
who were involved in the decision-making process the discussions fo
cused on: activities related to the decision to relocate, specifically fo
cused on placement panels; and activities related to multi-agency 
decision-making for relocation placements. In the focus groups with so
cial workers, questions under the following themes were explored: orga
nisation of the teams supporting adolescents exposed to extra-familial 
risk/harm and relocations; activities related to the decision to relocate; 
activities related to supporting the adolescent in their relocation place
ment; and the placement review process. In both sets of focus groups, 
participants were asked to estimate the time taken for the different ac
tivities associated with the relocation placements, and, when relevant, to 
share examples from previous cases they had supported.

Interview procedures and participants

In two local authorities, interviews were conducted with finance leads 
(n¼ 3: in one of the local authorities, two participants joined the inter
view). These were conducted by the researcher leading this cost study 
and supported by a second researcher. In the third local authority, the fi
nance lead was not available to meet with the researchers; however, they 
completed a template and sent relevant finance information by email 
which was included in the data analysis.

The template for the interviews with finance leads was adapted from 
previous research focused on the costs of placing children in out-of- 
home care (Ward et al., 2008). These were semi-structured and focused 
on placement fees and allowances payments made for relocation place
ments, staff salaries and organisational overheads.

Data analysis

As detailed earlier in this article, a ‘bottom-up’ unit costing approach 
was utilised. This approach is recognised as an appropriate methodology 
to capture variations in cost according to differences in the needs and 
circumstances of children and adolescents and diversity of practice 
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(Beecham, 2000). The approach has been used previously to examine 
the costs and outcomes associated with placements in out-of-home care 
(Ward et al., 2008). This previous research included the development of 
a conceptual framework which sets out a series of eight social work pro
cesses to support children in out-of-home care, from the initial decision 
to place a child or adolescent, through to them ceasing to be in care 
(Ward et al., 2008). An integral component of this approach is a time- 
use study to include the costs of social work time as well as placement 
fees and allowances (Ward et al., 2008). Data are captured systematically 
about the different personnel who are involved and whether input is pro
vided by partner agencies.

The findings reported in this article focus on the social work activities 
associated with relocation placements, categorised into three overarching 
processes utilising the aforementioned conceptual framework (Ward 
et al., 2008): 

1. decision to relocate adolescents (including moving them to 
the placement); 

2. support provided to the relocation placement; and 
3. review of the relocation placement. 

The focus groups were audio-recorded and transcribed, and the data 
were thematically analysed by the second researcher with the guidance 
of the lead researcher utilising the conceptual framework developed by 
Ward et al. (2008). The researchers captured information about the na
ture and availability of financial data and interviewees sent financial in
formation following the interviews. Summaries were then prepared for 
each local authority and data from the two focus groups, interviews and 
any additional documents shared by the participants (e.g. remit of pan
els) were triangulated to estimate unit costs.

Where participants from the focus groups provided information about 
their involvement in activities but were unable to provide time estimates 
these were supplemented from relevant time-use data extracted from 
existing, published research (Ward et al., 2008; Holmes and McDermid 
2012). These supplementary data were recently verified and validated with 
a sample of nineteen local authorities in England (Bowyer et al., 2018). 
When finance leads were unable to provide detailed cost information, 
data were drawn from Section 251 (Department for Education, 2019): an 
annual return of local authorities planned and actual expenditure on edu
cation and child welfare, as part of the Apprenticeships, Skills, Children 
and Learning Act 2009. The categorisation of organisational overheads 
was also based on previous research (Selwyn et al., 2009).

The time-use estimates and the associated unit costs for each of relo
cation processes are set out in the following section. Time-use estimates 
and unit costs are reported as a range, based on average figures across 
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the three participating local authorities. Times have been rounded to the 
closest fifteen minutes.

Ethics

The ethics committee at the University of Bedfordshire granted ethical 
approval for this part of the research project. Research participants gave 
verbal consent to participate in the focus groups/interviews.

Limitations

The fieldwork was initially planned to be conducted in person; however, 
due to the COVID-19 pandemic, it was shifted online. This change 
resulted in some minor limitations, particularly regarding sound quality 
and potential constraints on the group dynamics.

Moreover, the findings presented in this article are from a small- 
scale exploratory study and are not intended to be representative of all 
situations where relocation placements are utilised for adolescents 
deemed at risk of extra-familial risk/harm nor to ensure generalisation. 
Consequently, there are some limitations with gaps in the data because 
of small numbers of relocations and a reliance on self-report data for the 
time-use study. Nevertheless, this article sets out vital contextual infor
mation and provides an indicative approach to understanding the costs 
associated with relocation placements, which has the potential to be rep
licated, on a larger scale, in the future.

Findings

As aforementioned, the focus groups facilitated the collection of qualita
tive data to provide information about the local context of each of the 
three local authorities. An understanding of the broader issues and 
context in which child welfare services operate is pivotal to meaningfully 
analyse time-use data and estimate the costs associated with decision- 
making and the provision of different types of services (Holmes and 
McDermid, 2012).

Local authorities and extra-familial risk/harm contexts

Participants stressed that each adolescent had a unique context influ
enced by the type of extra-familial risk/harm, risk level, familial environ
ment and personal characteristics. Building trusting relationships with 
these adolescents was identified as crucial and participants indicated that 
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they had structures and specialised teams to provide additional support 
to this group. However, they identified differences in the way support 
was provided and how professionals worked. In the local authority with 
a low rate of relocation, there had been investment in a new service fo
cused on supporting adolescents on the edge of care. In the local author
ity with a high rate of relocation, participants reported a high turnover 
of social workers, which was described as compromising relationships 
with adolescents. Moreover, there were some differences in the groups 
of adolescents supported by these local authorities: In those with a high 
and medium rate of relocation professionals talked mostly about adoles
cents with ‘gang’ affiliation or/and in a context that had put their life 
at risk.

Time-use study

As aforementioned, the conceptual framework developed by Ward et al. 
(2008) to understand how child welfare practitioners use their time was 
utilised for this study. The approach is based on the time spent for an in
dividual case with a focus on the needs and circumstances of an individ
ual adolescent, and variations in practice, rather than accounting for all 
time use, usually akin to workload studies. A comparison of the two dif
fering approaches to capturing time use in social work and the relative 
merits is set out elsewhere (Holmes et al., 2014). For this study, the con
ceptual framework was utilised to focus on the professional practice and 
time spent around the decision to place an adolescent in a relocation 
placement, support their relocation and review the placement.

The variability of the needs and circumstances of the adolescents was 
reflected in the time use data, with participants highlighting the vast 
range of time spent on specific activities to respond to the differing 
needs and circumstances of the adolescents. Furthermore, even in the lo
cal authority deemed to have high rates of relocation placements, the 
relative occurrences were small, and as such plans to support the adoles
cents were predominantly individualised, and there were few prior expe
riences to draw on to inform decisions. The unique circumstances and 
needs make it more difficult to determine average times for activities, 
and consequently a range of times and costs are reported in this arti
cle—the fieldwork in the three local authorities identified that there is 
no definitive amount of time for relocation placements where there is 
potential risk of extra-familial risk/harm. This reflects the findings of 
Ward et al. (2008) who identified a small group of adolescents who re
quire bespoke out-of-home care, and that often needs cannot be 
met locally.

The data set out below encompass the time taken from when a deci
sion to relocate is made. Participants indicated that activities were 
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carried out prior to this decision, often working with families to avoid 
placement in out-of-home care, with support provided by children’s serv
ices, partner agencies or a package of support provided by multi
ple agencies.

Participants in all three local authorities indicated that in most cases it 
was difficult to find placements that met adolescents’ needs (e.g. health, 
educational and emotional needs), that were safe (e.g. no other rival 
adolescents were in that placement), whilst also being a place where 
they could build new relationships. For these reasons, professionals first 
tried to relocate the entire family, avoiding a placement in out-of-home 
care, or alternatively using an out-of-area foster care placement, even if 
that involved paying extra allowances and providing additional resources. 
When those options failed, professionals would then opt to place adoles
cents in residential care homes.

Decision to relocate

In all three areas, decisions to relocate adolescents were made as part of 
‘panel’ meetings with groups of senior managers discussing service 
responses. Data were captured about the activities leading up to the 
panel meeting, during the meeting and any resulting actions. As shown 
in Table 1, activities were broken down for the different personnel in
volved in the panel meeting. The time use estimates reported are per ad
olescent, not for the entire panel meeting. Participants reported that the 
number of relocation cases discussed at panel varied substantially—some 
weeks it was none and in the local authority with high rate of relocation 
some weeks several cases were discussed.

Participants in the local authority with a high rate of relocation 
reported that social workers indicated on the panel paperwork that ‘the 
young person cannot stay in the area’ and described the panel as a place 
to reflect on what is best for each adolescent and the costs associated 
with different options. Panel was expressed as frequently exploring alter
native options to relocations, and to some extent was perceived as chal
lenging the assessment of social workers. On the other hand, participants 
in the local authorities with medium and low rates of relocation consid
ered that panel was a place where value for money was discussed and 
where the recommendations of social workers and their managers were 
accounted for and mostly supported. This aligned with the culture of 
avoiding relocation and trust in social workers’ and managers’ 
recommendations.

The most time-intensive part of the process was post-panel, which in
cluded finding an appropriate placement for the adolescent. Participants 
reported substantial variability determined by the availability of provi
sion and the needs and circumstances of the adolescent. Participants 
were not able to provide specific time estimates but offered examples of 
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substantial amounts of time being spent over several days, by multiple 
professionals trying to find a placement.

Support provided to the relocation placement

Once adolescents are moved to relocation placements they need ongoing 
support. The central focus of this process was on the time spent by the 
adolescents’ allocated social worker. Participants in the three participat
ing local authorities highlighted the need for work to be carried out im
mediately after the adolescent had moved to help settle them into their 
new placement and to arrange access to necessary support services. 
Participants highlighted a variety of challenges. They focused mainly on 
the distance, the reduction of in-person meetings, and the consequent 
implications for the relationship between adolescents and social workers. 
They also indicated that often adolescents would need to join long wait
ing lists for services such as mental health services, and that even if the 
adolescent had been on a waiting list for a specific service in their own 
area, new referrals were necessary, which led to delays in accessing 
these services.

Social workers reported that they would usually visit once every four 
weeks, each visit lasting approximately one hour. The frequency of in- 
person meetings varied according to the needs and circumstances of the 
adolescent and whether safeguarding concerns remained despite the re
location. The travel time for each visit was disproportionate to the 
length of visit, with travel in some cases taking up to four hours each 
way. Social workers also reported ongoing telephone contact with ado
lescents in between the in-person visits. Furthermore, social workers 

Table 1. Processes, activities and time spent (range) on the decision to relocate.

Process Main activities Time spent (range)  

in hours and minutes

Pre-panel Social workers with the support of managers, prepare 

papers for panel

3 h 30 min to  

12 h 45 min

Administrators share papers with panel members

Panel members read papers before panel

Panel Social workers, managers or head services present 

papers at panel

1 h 45 min to 3 h

Panel members discuss the possible relocation

Administrators or another member of panel take 

minutes of the discussion and update case file

Post-panel Social workers with the support of managers, find a 

placement that meets the needs of the adolescent

38 h 15 mina

aTime spent for these activities is taken from previous research (Ward et al., 2008; Bowyer et al., 

2018) in lieu of specific time use figures being provided by participants. These figures reflect the 

reported complexities associated with placement finding activities for adolescents with com

plex needs.
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indicated that referrals to services, ensuring physical and mental health 
support, and making education arrangements (where applicable) added 
to the time spent to support the relocation placement. When discussing 
time to support relocation placements on an ongoing basis, social work
ers indicated disproportionate levels of activity in comparison with other 
adolescents that they were supporting. In Table 2, we provide time esti
mates per month based on the number of visits and meetings estimated 
with the social workers and supplemented with time use data from previ
ous research with a similar population (Ward et al., 2008; Bowyer 
et al., 2018).

Review of the relocation placement

In England, all placements for children in out-of-home care are subject 
to review at statutory timeframes. Participants in the focus groups indi
cated that the main aim of the review was understanding if the place
ment met the needs of each adolescent, whilst also reflecting on when 
would be the best time to move the adolescent back to the area (i.e. 
when risks had been mitigated). Within this process, we identified less 
variability in the time taken for reviews. In two of the local authorities if 
the placement was deemed to be ‘high cost’ it was also reviewed at a 
separate panel. In one of these additional meetings also happened 
monthly to ensure the monitoring of the placement.

The figures presented in Table 3 include activities prior to the review 
or panel meeting, during the meeting and any actions resulting from the 
discussions.

Legal interventions

In England, approximately three-quarters of children in out-of-home 
care have a legal order whereby the decision to place them in out-of- 
home care has been made as part of (family) court proceedings 
(Department for Education, 2020). The findings from this study indi
cated that relocation placements also encompassed legal orders, such as 
Deprivation of Liberty (DoL) or Mental Health Sectioning as well as 

Table 2. Process, activity and time spent (range) on monthly support provided to the reloca

tion placement.

Process Main activities Time spent (range) in hours 

and minutes (per month)

Support placement Setting up additional services 33 h 45 min to 42 h 15 min

Conduct visits

Stay in contact with adolescent
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Care Orders (as part of family court proceedings). The trend of an in
crease in the use of DoLs in England has recently been highlighted by 
Roe and Ryan (2022) and is counter to efforts to progress anti- 
oppressive practice in children’s social care.

Furthermore, the costs associated with obtaining these different legal 
orders can be extensive and participants reported that where restrictive 
legal orders had been obtained their time spent was increased exponen
tially. The costs associated with Care Orders have been reported by 
Ward et al. (2008) who highlight substantial variability in the estimated 
costs, reporting an average cost of £4,864. Research by Shah et al. (2011)
indicated that the estimated average cost of a single DoL assessment 
was £1,277. The costs associated with mental health tend to focus on 
those associated with in-patient stays rather than the application for the 
legal order; consequently, there is not a comparable unit cost of section
ing an individual as a result of Mental Health (McCrone et al., 2008).

Unit costs

As a precursor to providing financial data, the participating local author
ities were asked whether they could distinguish the costs associated with 
relocation placements resulting from extra-familial risk/harm, from other 
placements. All local authorities reported a disconnect between their fi
nancial recording systems and child-level information (needs and reason 
for placements), although some manual work had been carried out in 
one of them to link data and examine the fees and allowances being 
paid to placements out-of-area of the authority in accordance with the 
needs and circumstances of the adolescents. The disconnect between fi
nance and child-level data reflects findings from previous research (see 
Holmes and McDermid, 2012). Furthermore, the inability to link finan
cial and child-level data negates the potential to assess the value for 
money of placements (Suh and Holmes, 2022).

Table 3. Processes, activities and time spent (range) on review of the relocation placement.

Process Main activities Time spent (range)  

in hours and minutes

Standard review panel Prepare and read papers 13 ha

Discuss papers

Update case file

Specialised review panel Prepare and read papers 5 h 45 min

Discuss papers

Update case file

Additional meeting Meeting 45 min

aTime spent for these activities is taken from previous research (Ward et al., 2008; Bowyer et al., 

2018) in lieu of specific time use figures being provided by participants.
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Participants from all three local authorities indicated that the place
ment fees and allowances for relocation placements constituted some of 
the highest for children in out-of-home care. Often the placements were 
provided by the private and independent sector and/or were deemed to 
be specialist provisions to meet specific needs. Furthermore, participants 
indicated that in most instances the placement fees and allowances were 
paid by children’s services and that arrangements for joint funding with 
partner agencies (such as education and health) were in the minority. 
Only one of the local authorities was able to provide data about place
ment fees—these ranged from £690 to £6,300 per week. Relocation 
placements were cited as being the most expensive of these. For compar
ison, nationally applicable placement unit costs for out-of-authority 
placements in England average £3,682 per week (Curtis and 
Burns, 2020).

Following the identification of the range of times for the processes 
outlined above, the activity data were linked to salary and overhead in
formation to calculate unit costs. The unit costs per hour for each of the 
personnel were multiplied by the times reported in Tables 1–3 and the 
unit costs for each of the processes, reported as a range, are detailed 
in Table 4.

As demonstrated throughout the preceding sections of this article, the 
findings indicate substantial variation in the activities and consequently 
unit costs associated with relocation placements. Taking all the processes 
together along with the cost of placement fees and allowances it is possi
ble to present low and high estimates of unit costs of relocation place
ments. Utilising the lowest unit costs for each of the processes, and 
lowest reported placement fees and allowances, the low estimate for a 
placement lasting six months is in the region of £22,000. In contrast, us
ing the highest unit costs for each of the processes, highest reported 
placement fees and allowances, plus the cost of a DoL assessment, the 
upper-end estimated unit cost is in the region of £170,000. The qualita
tive and contextual data gathered as part of the focus groups and discus
sions with finance leads suggest that the unit costs are likely to be 
weighted towards the top end of this range. These cost estimations high
light the variability in the needs and circumstances of the adolescents 

Table 4. Unit costs of relocation processes.

Process Unit costs (range)

Pre-panel £165–791

Panel £166–176

Post-panel £1,678–1,821

Placement support (monthly) £1,402–1,659

Standard review panel £606–665

Specialised review panel £258–433
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who experience relocation placements, along with differences in the ser
vice response, and decision-making processes between local authorities 
in England. Furthermore, although this is a small-scale feasibility study, 
the findings indicate that where relocation placements are provided, 
these are some of the costliest for local authorities.

Discussion

Variations in costs

In all three local authorities, participants consistently indicated the individ
ualised nature of making decisions to relocate adolescents deemed to be 
at risk of extra-familial harm. Reflecting this, we reported a range of unit 
costs, setting out the different types of decision making, levels of activity 
and variations in the fees paid for placements. Despite the variability, pre
senting a range of unit costs moves us closer to explore the complexity of 
decision making and the nuanced approach required to support adoles
cents and their families. Variability in the costs of child welfare is not a 
new issue, and concerns were first raised in the late 1990s about the deliv
ery of effective child welfare and an appropriate cost (Knapp and Lowin, 
1998). Since then, few studies have attempted to offer explanations by set
ting out potential sources of cost variations in children’s social care 
(Beecham, 2006). Through this small-scale feasibility study, we hope to in
crease awareness of the relevance of exploring variations in unit costs, 
and offer a methodological approach that incorporates qualitative meth
ods into economic evaluation of child welfare services. The time-use study 
also offers a way to explore the complexity associated with social work 
decision making and commissioning of relocation placements.

Defining and attributing outcomes

A fundamental issue highlighted early in this article is the gap in evi
dence about the outcomes associated with or attributed to relocation 
placements. The disconnect between finance and child-level data systems 
reported in this article exacerbates the difficulties of attributing out
comes, and it is evident that within the three participating local authori
ties, analysis was not being carried out to examine the outcomes being 
achieved by the relocation placements. Furthermore, Firmin et al. (2022)
highlighted that relocation placements were often considered to be a 
step towards a specific outcome rather than an outcome per se.

Within the field of child welfare, difficulties attributing outcomes are 
commonplace (Sebba et al., 2017; La Valle et al., 2019; FitzSimons and 
McCracken, 2020). Furthermore, Parr and Churchill (2020) argued that 
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the needs, services and outcomes of families need to be viewed holisti
cally, and that there is a myriad of socio-economic factors that are out
side of the control of local authority children’s services departments. 
This is also central when considering the service response to extra- 
familial risk/harm, and how adolescents can be diverted, or moved from 
immediate safeguarding concerns within their community.

Early intervention

Relocation placements in response to extra-familial risk/harm are not 
commonplace, and even in the local authority categorised as having a 
high rate of relocations, the numbers constitute a small proportion of 
adolescents who are placed by children’s services. Avoidance of reloca
tion placements, particularly relocation as part of a legal order rather 
than a voluntary arrangement, was considered a ‘last resort’. Alongside 
this perspective, there is a growing recognition and a developing evi
dence base of the need to support adolescents at risk of extra-familial 
harm through holistic interventions that create safety in young people’s 
communities and subsequently avoid placements in care (see e.g. Firmin 
and Lloyd C, 2020). In recent years, the largest growing cohort of chil
dren entering care are those in the adolescent population, thought to be 
a result of extra-familial harm (Children’s Commissioner, 2019; Bennett 
et al., 2020; Holmes, 2021).

Costs to the public purse

For the most part, the costs associated with relocation placements are 
met by child welfare. More broadly, there has been a growing recogni
tion that costs should be studied from a holistic multi-agency viewpoint 
instead of looking at children’s services in isolation (Hannon et al., 2010; 
La Valle et al., 2019; Holmes, 2021). This becomes particularly pertinent 
in analyses of costs that progress to assessing costs within the context of 
longer-term outcomes, and subsequently value for money. Incorporating 
the long-term perspective is an intrinsic difficulty for child welfare, 
whereby often benefits, financial or social, are not realised for some 
time (Ward et al., 2008; Feinstein et al., 2017; Bowyer et al., 2018).

Conclusion

Supporting adolescents and their families where there is extra-familial 
risk/harm is a developing component of child welfare services in 
England. This article sets out preliminary work to understand the finan
cial costs associated with service responses to extra-familial risk/harm 
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where it is deemed that adolescents cannot be safeguarded in their local
ity. The study did not seek to assess the cost–effectiveness of relocation 
placements in response to extra-familial risk/harm—that will be a neces
sary future endeavour. However, the position of the findings reported 
here, alongside the qualitative research (Wroe et al., 2023), highlights the 
need to consider financial costs within the context of collective moral 
and societal responsibilities to provide the right services, at the right 
time, to achieve the best possible outcomes and safeguard adolescents. 
Relocation placements are not an outcome per se, but a step in a path
way that needs to be carefully considered within the context of the im
pact of the relocation on the mental health and well-being of the 
adolescents, and the unintended negative consequences of disrupting 
supportive and positive relationships with families, peers and schools 
(Wroe et al., 2023).

Acknowledgements

The authors would like to acknowledge the time that professionals gave 
to take part in the research, and to thank them for this.

Funding

The Securing Safety research project was funded by Samworth Foundation.

Conflict of interest statement. None declared.

References

Acocella, I. (2012) ‘The focus groups in social research: Advantages and disadvan
tages’, Quality & Quantity, 46(4), pp. 1125–36.

ADCS. (2018) Safeguarding Pressures Phase 6, Tamil Nadu, Chennai, ADCS.
Bateman, T. (2017) The State of Youth Justice in 2017: An Overview of Trends and 

Developments, London, National Association for Youth Justice.
Beecham, J. (2000) Unit Costs—not Exactly Child’s Play: A Guide to Estimating Unit 

Costs for Child Welfare, England, The Department of Health, Dartington Social 
Research Unit, and the Personal Social Services Research Unit at the University 
of Kent.

Beecham, J. (2006) ‘Why costs vary in children’s care services’, Journal of Children's 
Services, 1(3), pp. 50–62. https://doi.org/10.1108/17466660200600023

Bennett, D. L., Mason, K. E., Schl€uter, D. K., Wickham, S., Lai, E. T., Alexiou, A., 
Barr, B. and Taylor-Robinson, D. (2020) ‘Trends in inequalities in Children 
Looked after in England between 2004 and 2019: A local area ecological analysis’, 
BMJ Open, 10(11), pp. e041774. https://doi.org/10.1136/bmjopen-2020-041774

Bowyer, S., Gillson, D., Holmes, L., Preston, O. and Trivedi, H. (2018) Edge of Care 
Cost Calculator Change Project Report, Darlington, Research in Practice.

Page 18 of 21 L. Holmes et al. 

D
ow

nloaded from
 https://academ

ic.oup.com
/bjsw

/advance-article/doi/10.1093/bjsw
/bcae109/7701428 by guest on 30 July 2024

https://doi.org/10.1108/17466660200600023
https://doi.org/10.1136/bmjopen-2020-041774


Children’s Commissioner. (2019) ‘Stability Index 2019, Overview Report’, available 
online at: https://www.childrenscommissioner.gov.uk/wp-content/uploads/2019/07/ 
cco-stability-index-2019.pdf (accessed April 26, 2024).

Coffey, A. (2014) ‘Real Voices: Child Sexual Exploitation in Greater Manchester, An 
Independent Report. It's not OK’, available online at: https://new.basw.co.uk/sites/ 
default/files/resources/basw_103119-3_0.pdf (accessed April 26, 2024)

Curtis, L. A. and Burns, A. (2020) Unit Costs of Health & Social Care 2020. Unit 
Costs of Health and Social Care, PSSRU, England, University of Kent. https://doi. 
org/10.22024/UniKent/01.02.84818

Department for Education. (2019) Section 251 Financial Data Collection 2019 to 2020: 
Departmental Advice for Local Authorities Compiling their Budget Statement, 
London, Department for Education.

Department for Education. (2020) Children Looked after in England Including 
Adoption: 2019 to 2020, London, Department for Education, available online at: 
https://explore-education-statistics.service.gov.uk/find-statistics/children-looked-af 
ter-in-england-including-adoptions/2020 (Accessed 26 April 2024).

Featherstone, B., Gupta, A., Morris, K. and Warner, J. (2018) ‘Let’s stop feeding the 
risk monster: Towards a social model of ‘child protection’, Families, Relationships 
and Societies, 7(1), pp. 07–22. https://doi.org/10.1332/204674316X14552878034622

Feinstein, L., Chowdry, H. and Asmussen, K. (2017) ‘On estimating the fiscal benefits 
of early intervention’, National Institute Economic Review, 240(1), pp. R15–R29. 
https://doi.org/10.1177/002795011724000111

Firmin, C. (2019) ‘Relocation, relocation, relocation: Home and school-moves for 
children affected extra-familial risks during adolescence’, Children’s Geographies, 
20(5), pp. 523–35. https://doi.org/10.1080/14733285.2019.1598545

Firmin, C. (2017) ‘Contextual risk, individualised responses: An assessment of safe
guarding responses to nine cases of peer-on-peer abuse’, Child Abuse Review, 27 
(1), pp. 42–57. https://doi.org/10.1002/car.2449

Firmin, C. and Lloyd, J. (2020) Contextual Safeguarding: A 2020 Update on the 
Conceptual, Strategic and Operational Framework, Luton, England, University of 
Bedfordshire, Contextual Safeguarding Network.

Firmin, C., Wroe, L. and Bernard, D. (2022) ‘Last resort or best interest? Exploring 
the risk and safety factors that inform the rates of relocation for young people 
abused in extra-familial settings’, The British Journal of Social Work, 52(1), pp. 
573–92. https://doi.org/10.1093/bjsw/bcab106

FitzSimons, A. and McCracken, K. (2020) Child Welfare Innovation Programme, 
Round 2 Final Report, London, Department for Education.

Franklin, J., Larkham, J. and Mansoor, M. (2023) The Well-Worn Path: Children’s 
Services Spending 2010–11 to 2021–22, London, Pro Bono Economics.

Hannon, C., Bazalgette, L. and Wood, C. (2010) In Loco Parentis: “To Deliver the 
Best for Looked after Children, the State Must Be a Confident Parent … ”. 
London, Demos.

HM Government. (2018) Working Together to Safeguard Children and Their Families: 
A Guide to Inter-Agency Working to Safeguard and Promote the Welfare of 
Children, London, HM Government.

Holmes, L., Landsverk, J., Ward, H., Rolls-Reutz, J., Saldana, L., Wulczyn, F. and 
Chamberlain, P. (2014) ‘Cost calculator methods for estimating casework time in 
child welfare services: A promising approach for use in implementation of 
evidence-based practices and other service innovations’, Children and Youth 

Cost of Relocation Page 19 of 21 

D
ow

nloaded from
 https://academ

ic.oup.com
/bjsw

/advance-article/doi/10.1093/bjsw
/bcae109/7701428 by guest on 30 July 2024

https://www.childrenscommissioner.gov.uk/wp-content/uploads/2019/07/cco-stability-index-2019.pdf
https://www.childrenscommissioner.gov.uk/wp-content/uploads/2019/07/cco-stability-index-2019.pdf
https://new.basw.co.uk/sites/default/files/resources/basw_103119-3_0.pdf
https://new.basw.co.uk/sites/default/files/resources/basw_103119-3_0.pdf
https://doi.org/10.22024/UniKent/01.02.84818
https://doi.org/10.22024/UniKent/01.02.84818
https://explore-education-statistics.service.gov.uk/find-statistics/children-looked-after-in-england-including-adoptions/2020
https://explore-education-statistics.service.gov.uk/find-statistics/children-looked-after-in-england-including-adoptions/2020
https://doi.org/10.1332/204674316X14552878034622
https://doi.org/10.1177/002795011724000111
https://doi.org/10.1080/14733285.2019.1598545
https://doi.org/10.1002/car.2449
https://doi.org/10.1093/bjsw/bcab106


Services Review, 39, pp. 169–76. https://doi.org/http://dx.doi.org/10.1016/j.child 
youth.2013.10.003

Holmes, L. and McDermid, S. (2012) Understanding Costs and Outcomes in Child 
Welfare Services: A Comprehensive Costing Approach to Managing Your 
Resources, London, Jessica Kingsley Publishers.

Holmes, L. (2021) Child Welfare Cost Pressures and Variations in Unit Costs. London, 
Department for Education.

Jay, A. (2014) Independent Inquiry into Child Sexual Exploitation in Rotherham 
(1997–2013), Rotherham, Rotherham LCSB.

Knapp, M. and Lowin, A. (1998) ‘Childcare outcomes: Economic perspectives and 
issues’, Children & Society, 12(3), pp. 169–79. https://doi.org/10.1111/j.1099-0860. 
1998.tb00061.x

La Valle, I., Hart, D., Holmes, L. and Pinto, V. S. (2019) How Do We Know if Child 
Welfare Services Make a Difference? Development of an Outcomes Framework, 
Oxford, Nuffield Foundation; Rees Centre, University of Oxford.

Lloyd, J., Manister, M. and Wroe, L. E. (2023) ‘Social care responses to children who 
experience criminal exploitation and violence: The conditions for a welfare re
sponse’, The British Journal of Social Work, 53(8), pp. 3725–43.

Ofsted. (2021) ‘Ofsted’s Review of Sexual Abuse in Cchools and Colleges,’ available 
online at: https://www.gov.uk/government/news/ofsteds-review-of-sexual-abuse-in- 
schools-and-colleges (accessed April 30, 2024).

McCrone, P., Dhanasiri, S., Patel, A., Knapp, M. and Lawton-Smith, S. (2008) Paying 
the Price. The Cost of Mental Health Care in England to, 2026, pp. 1–165, London, 
King’s Fund.

Parr, S. and Churchill, H. (2020) ‘The troubled families programme: Learning about 
policy impact through realist case study research’, Social Policy & Administration, 
54(1), pp. 134–47. https://doi.org/10.1111/spol.12529

Roe, A. and Ryan, M. (2022) Deprivation of Liberty: A Review of Published 
Judgements, London, Nuffield Family Justice Observatory.

Sebba, J., Luke, N., McNeish, D. and Rees, A. (2017) Child Welfare Innovation 
Programme: Final Evaluation Report, London, Department for Education.

Selwyn, J., Sempik, J., Thurston, P. and Wijedasa, D. (2009) Adoption and the 
Inter-Agency Fee, Department for Children, Schools and Families, Bristol, England, 
University of Bristol.

Shah, A., Pennington, M., Heginbotham, C. and Donaldson, C. (2011) ‘Deprivation 
of liberty safeguards in England: Implementation costs’, The British Journal of 
Psychiatry: The Journal of Mental Science, 199(3), pp. 232–8. https://doi:10.1192/ 
bjp.bp.110.089474

Stride, G. and Woods, M. (2024) The State of Local Government Finance in England 
2024, London, Local Government Information Unit.

Suh, E. and Holmes, L. (2022) ‘A critical review of cost-effectiveness research in 
children's social care: What have we learnt so far’, Social Policy & Administration, 
56(5), pp. 742–56.

Ward, H., Holmes, L. and Soper, J. (2008) Costs and Consequences of Placing 
Children in Care, London, Jessica Kingsley Publishers.

Williams, A., Wood, S., Warner, N., Cummings, A., Hodges, H., El-Banna, A. and 
Daher, S. (2020) Unlocking the Facts: Young People Referred to Secure Children’s 
Homes, London, What Works for Children’s Social Care.

Page 20 of 21 L. Holmes et al. 

D
ow

nloaded from
 https://academ

ic.oup.com
/bjsw

/advance-article/doi/10.1093/bjsw
/bcae109/7701428 by guest on 30 July 2024

https://doi.org/http://dx.doi.org/10.1016/j.childyouth.2013.10.003
https://doi.org/http://dx.doi.org/10.1016/j.childyouth.2013.10.003
https://doi.org/10.1111/j.1099-0860.1998.tb00061.x
https://doi.org/10.1111/j.1099-0860.1998.tb00061.x
https://www.gov.uk/government/news/ofsteds-review-of-sexual-abuse-in-schools-and-colleges
https://www.gov.uk/government/news/ofsteds-review-of-sexual-abuse-in-schools-and-colleges
https://doi.org/10.1111/spol.12529
https://doi:10.1192
https://doi:10.1192


Wroe, L. E., Peace, D. and Firmin, C. (2023) ‘Relocating’ adolescents from risk be
yond the home: What do we learn when we ask about safety’, The British Journal 
of Social Work, 53(5), pp. 2958–78. https://doi.org/10.1093/bjsw/bcad077

© The Author(s) 2024. Published by Oxford University Press on behalf of The British Association of 
Social Workers.
This is an Open Access article distributed under the terms of the Creative Commons Attribution License 
(https://creativecommons.org/licenses/by/4.0/), which permits unrestricted reuse, distribution, and reproduction in 
any medium, provided the original work is properly cited.
British Journal of Social Work, 2024, 00, 1–21
https://doi.org/10.1093/bjsw/bcae109
Original article

Cost of Relocation Page 21 of 21 

D
ow

nloaded from
 https://academ

ic.oup.com
/bjsw

/advance-article/doi/10.1093/bjsw
/bcae109/7701428 by guest on 30 July 2024

https://doi.org/10.1093/bjsw/bcad077

	Active Content List
	Background
	Aims and objectives
	Methods
	Findings
	Discussion
	Conclusion
	Acknowledgements
	Funding
	References


